
 1 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

AGENDA 
 

CITY COUNCIL/SUCCESSOR AGENCY TO THE REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY FOR THE CITY OF 
COLTON/COLTON UTILITY AUTHORITY/COLTON PUBLIC FINANCING AUTHORITY/COLTON HOUSING 

AUTHORITY REGULAR MEETING 
 

TUESDAY, DECEMBER 6, 2016 - 5:00 P.M. 
 

COUNCIL CHAMBERS 
~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 

CLOSED SESSION – 5:00 P.M. 
 
CLOSED SESSION CALLED TO ORDER 

ROLL CALL 

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
PUBLIC COMMENT         Limit 5 Minutes  
 

This is the portion of the meeting specifically set aside to invite your comments regarding Closed Session items; 
however, any matter that requires action will be referred to staff for investigation and report at a subsequent Council 
meeting. The Council is prohibited by law from discussing or taking immediate action on items during this public 
comment period. 
 
Persons desiring to submit paperwork to the City Council Members shall provide copy of any paperwork to the City 
Clerk for the Official Record.  
 
Speakers will be limited to 5 minutes; provided, however, that the presiding officer shall have certain discretion to 
extend or limit time as provided for in the City Council Manual of Procedure. 
 

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
 
 
 
 

CITY OF COLTON 
City Hall 

650 N. La Cadena Drive 
Colton, CA 92324 

Website:  www.coltonca.gov   

Mayor Richard A. DeLaRosa 
Council Members: 

David J. Toro – District 1 
Summer Zamora Jorrin – District 2 

 Frank J. Navarro – District 3 
Dr. Luis S. González – District 4 

Deirdre H. Bennett – District 5 
Isaac T. Suchil – District 6 

 

City Treasurer Aurelio De La Torre 
 

City Manager William R. Smith 
City Attorney Carlos Campos 
City Clerk Carolina R. Padilla 

 

12/06/2016 City Council Agenda

http://www.coltonca.gov/


 2 

A. CONFERENCE WITH LABOR NEGOTIATORS  
Pursuant to Government Code Section 54957.6 
Agency designated representatives:  Elvie Balderrama, Human Resources Director  
Employee Groups:  General Unit, Mid-Management Unit, Confidential Group, Colton Police 
Officers Association, Colton Police Management Association, Colton Police Dispatchers 
Association, Colton Fire Association; International Brotherhood of Electrical Workers (IBEW), 
Water and Wastewater 
 

B. CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL – EXISTING LITIGATION 
Pursuant to Gov. Code sec. 54956.9(d)(1) 
Name of Case:  Manuel Bravo Martinez v. City of Colton, et al. 
Case Number:  US District Court, Central District, Case No. 5:16-cv-00702 

 
C. CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL – EXISTING LITIGATION 

Pursuant to Gov. Code sec. 54956.9(d)(1) 
Name of Case:  Ronald Collins v. City of Colton, et al. 
Case Number:  San Bernardino County Superior Court Case No. CIVDS 1501669; US District Court, 
Central District, Case No. 5:15-cv-01771 

 
CITY ATTORNEY ORAL REPORT ON CLOSED SESSION ACTIONS 

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
 

RULES OF DECORUM 
 
To help conduct the business of the City Council in an orderly fashion, the City Council has adopted rules pertaining 
to decorum and order, as provided for in the City Council Manual of Procedure.  The City Council will strictly enforce 
these rules in order to allow full expression of ideas and opinions by councilmembers, staff and the public.  
Generally, the City's rules of decorum prohibit comments or actions which willfully disrupt the meeting.  All remarks 
and questions shall be addressed to the Council as a whole and not to any particular member.  No individual 
Councilmember or member of the City staff shall be questioned without first obtaining permission from the Presiding 
Officer.  The City Council asks that all persons - including councilmembers, staff and the public - act and speak 
respectfully.  

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
OPEN SESSION 

 

6:00 P.M. 
OPEN SESSION CALLED TO ORDER 

INVOCATION   Pastor Tim Isom - Faith Way Nazarene 

FLAG SALUTE  Louie Barrera & Steve Ferrance, American Legion Post 155 

ROLL CALL 
~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
 

CITY CLERK ITEMS 
 
CANVASS OF ELECTION 

12/06/2016 City Council Agenda



 3 

(1) Approve and adopt a Resolution of the City Council Reciting the Fact of the General Municipal 
Election held on November 8, 2016, declaring the Result and such other matters as provided by 
Law, RESOLUTION NO. R-117-16. [Staff Person: S. Sanchez] 

 
PRESENTATION TO OUTGOING CITY OFFICIALS BY INVITED DIGNITARIES / REPRESENTATIVES 
 
COMMENTS FROM OUTGOING CITY OFFICIALS 
 
OATH OF OFFICE 
 
City Clerk Carolina R. Padilla calls the newly-elected City Officials forward. The Oath of Office and the 
Certificate of Election is issued by City Clerk Carolina R. Padilla. 
 
~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 

RECEPTION IN THE LOBBY 
 

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
 

OPEN SESSION CALLED TO ORDER 

ROLL CALL 
 

COMMENTS FROM INCOMING CITY OFFICIALS 
 

CEREMONIAL MATTERS Presentations, Awards, Proclamations 
 

MAYOR AND COUNCIL ITEMS 
 
GIFT DISCLOSURES 

Prior to rendering a decision in any proceeding involving a license, permit, contract or other entitlement pending before the 
city council, any council member who has received been promised a gift or gifts aggregating $50.00 or more in value within 
the preceding twelve months from a party or participant in the proceeding shall disclose that fact either orally or in writing 
during open session.  This disclosure shall be made part of the official public record of the proceeding, either as part of the 
minutes of the meeting or as a separate writing filed with the city. (CMC Section 2.04.030) 

 
AB 1234 ORAL REPORTS 

Members of the city council shall provide brief reports on meetings attended at the expense of the city. (GC 
Section 53232.3(d)) 

 
MAYOR AND COUNCIL ACTION ITEMS 
 

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
 

PUBLIC COMMENT           Limit 5 Minutes  
 

This is the portion of the meeting specifically set aside to invite your comments regarding Consent Calendar items and 
any matters within the jurisdiction of the City Council; however, any matter that requires action will be referred to staff 
for investigation and report at a subsequent Council meeting. The Council is prohibited by law from discussing or taking 
immediate action on items during this public comment period. 
 

12/06/2016 City Council Agenda



 4 

Persons desiring to submit paperwork to the City Council Members shall provide copy of any paperwork to the City 
Clerk for the Official Record.  
 

Speakers will be limited to 5 minutes; provided, however, that the presiding officer shall have certain discretion to 
extend or limit time as provided for in the City Council Manual of Procedure.  

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
 
CONSENT CALENDAR 
 

All matters listed under the Consent Calendar are considered by the City Council to be routine and will all be enacted by 
one motion. There will be no separate discussion of these items prior to the time the City Council votes on the motion, 
unless councilmembers, staff or the public request that specific items be discussed and/or removed for separate 
discussions or action. 
 

(2) Minutes – Approval of Minutes for the City Council Regular Meeting Held November15, 2016; 
Minutes for the Regular Adjourned Meeting held November 23, 2016; Minutes for the Special 
Meeting held November 23, 2016 on File in the Office of the City Clerk. [City Clerk Padilla] 
 

(3) Warrants – Approval of Payable Warrants #159375 to 159409 dated 11/10/2016 and totaling 
$266,220.64; voucher numbers 159410 to 159471 dated 11/17/2016 and totaling $340,472.70; 
voucher numbers 159472 to 159543 dated 11/23/2016 and totaling $188,489.52 and a payroll 
disbursement listing for the period 10/22/2016 to 11/04/2016 and totaling $763,488.16. [Staff 
Person: S. Dabbs] 
 

(4) Adopt Fine Increases – Approve a Resolution to adopt fine increases for commercial vehicle 
Municipal Code violations, RESOLUTION NO. R-118-16. [Staff Person: M. Owens] 
 

(5) Contract Amendment Department of Education Pre School – Adopt a Resolution approving 
Amendment No. 01 for State of California Contract CSPP-6399 for the provision of Pre-School 
services in the Early Childhood Education Division of the Community Services Department for 
Fiscal Year 2016-17 and amending the budget for the current fiscal year to account for increased 
funding, RESOLUTION NO. R-119-16. [Staff Person: D. Farrar] 
 

(6) Contract Amendment Department of Education School Age – Adopt a Resolution approving 
Amendment No. 01 for State of California Contract CCTR-6195 for the provision of  school age 
education services in the Early Childhood Education Division of the Community Services 
Department for Fiscal Year 2016-17 and amending the budget for the current fiscal year to 
account for increased funding, RESOLUTION NO. R-120-16. [Staff Person: D. Farrar] 

 
PUBLIC HEARINGS 

 
To speak on public hearing items, it is requested that you obtain a card from the City Clerk and complete it by noting 
the agenda item number, as well as whether you are in favor, opposition or neither, and give it to the City Clerk.  The 
applicant will be allowed 5 minutes to address the Council and all other persons will be allowed 3 minutes; provided, 
however, that the presiding officer shall have certain discretion to extend or limit time as provided for in the City 
Council Manual of Procedure. 

 
 

12/06/2016 City Council Agenda



 5 

(7) 2016 Building Code Adoption (by Reference) -  [Staff Person: M. Tomich] 
 

TIME AND PLACE FIXED TO CONSIDER A PUBLIC HEARING TO WAIVE FURTHER READING, READ BY 
TITLE ONLY AND INTRODUCE ORDINANCE NO. O-26-16, AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF 
THE CITY OF COLTON, CALIFORNIA, REPEALING AND REPLACING CHAPTERS 15 MUNICIPAL CODE 
AND  ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2016 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS 
CODE (CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS, TITLE 24); INCORPORATING THE 2016 CALIFORNIA 
BUILDING CODE, (INCORPORATING AND AMENDING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE); 
THE 2016 CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE; THE 2016 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE 
(INCORPORATING AND AMENDING THE 2014 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE); THE 2016 
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE (INCORPORATING AND AMENDING THE 2015 UNIFORM 
MECHANICAL CODE); THE 2016 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE (INCORPORATING AND AMENDING 
THE 2015 UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE); THE 2016 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE 
(INCORPORATING AND AMENDING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE); THE 2016 
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE (INCORPORATING AND AMENDING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE); 
AND THE 2015 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN 
ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES THERETO; ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 
UNIFORM CODE FOR THE ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS, 1997 EDITION; AND THE 
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, 2015 EDITION; WITH APPENDICES AND 
AMENDMENTS THERETO. 
 
Mayor announces the Public Hearing open. 
 
City Clerk submits the Affidavit of Publication and reports on protests or objections thereto. 
 
Staff Presentation. 

 
Public Comment. 
 
After hearing public comment, on motion by Councilmember __________, seconded by 
Councilmember _________, the Public Hearing is terminated. 
 
Consider: Waive full reading, read by title only and introduce ORDINANCE NO. O-26-16  
 
MOTION __________ SECOND __________ 
 

(8) Appeal - File Index No. DAP-001-371 - [Staff Person: M. Tomich] 
 

TIME AND PLACE FIXED TO CONSIDER A PUBLIC HEARING AND APPEAL TO ADOPT RESOLUTION 
NO. R-121-16 DENYING THE APPEAL AND UPHOLDING THE PLANNING COMMISSION’S DENIAL OF 
THE APPLICATION. 
 
Mayor announces the Public Hearing open. 
 
City Clerk submits the Affidavit of Publication and reports on protests or objections thereto. 

12/06/2016 City Council Agenda



 6 

Staff Presentation. 
 

Public Comment. 
 
After hearing public comment, on motion by Councilmember __________, seconded by 
Councilmember _________, the Public Hearing is terminated. 
 
Consider: Approve and adopt RESOLUTION NO. R-121-16.  
 
MOTION __________ SECOND __________ 

 
(9) A Specific Plan Amendment for amendments to the Colton’s Hub City Centre Specific Plan – 

Continued to December 20, 2016 City Council Meeting. [Staff Person: M. Tomich] 
 
BUSINESS ITEMS 
 
(10) Employment Agreement and Budget Resolution for the Executive Administrator to the Mayor and 

Council - Approve 1) the Employment Agreement between the City of Colton and the Executive 
Administrator to the Mayor and Council, and 2) Resolution R-116-16 increasing the general fund 
appropriations in the City Council Office by $9,771.42 for fiscal year 2016-2017, RESOLUTION NO. 
R-116-16. (continued from Special meeting of 11/23/16) 
 

MAYOR AND COUNCIL ORAL REPORTS AND COMMENTS 
 
CITY MANAGER’S REPORTS 
 

 Update – City Wide Median Plan (Oral Report) 
 

 Update – Residential Landscaping Requirements (Oral Report) 
 
ADJOURNMENT 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

POSTING STATEMENT: 
I, Sabdi Sanchez, Chief Deputy City Clerk or my designee, hereby certify that a true and correct, accurate copy of the foregoing 
agenda was posted Thursday, December 01, 2016, at least seventy-two (72) hours prior to the meeting per Government Code 

54954.2, at the following locations: 
 

City of Colton City Hall 650 N. La Cadena Drive 
City of Colton Website, www.coltonca.gov 

12/06/2016 City Council Agenda

http://www.coltonca.gov/


 7 

PROCEDURES FOR ADDRESSING CITY COUNCIL 
 
For the Official Record, it is requested that you obtain a card from the City Clerk and complete it by noting a specific 
item number on the Agenda, if applicable, or you can identify the subject that you wish to address under the Public 
Comment portion of the Agenda. The City Council encourages public input on all City issues within the Rules of 
Decorum.  Speakers will be limited to the time periods provided on the Agenda; provided, however, that the 
presiding officer shall have certain discretion to extend or limit time as provided for in the City Council Manual of 
Procedure. 

 
RULES OF DECORUM 

 
To help conduct the business of the City Council in an orderly fashion, the City Council has adopted rules pertaining 
to decorum and order, as provided for in the City Council Manual of Procedure.  The City Council will strictly 
enforce these rules in order to allow full expression of ideas and opinions by councilmembers, staff and the public.  
Generally, the City's rules of decorum prohibit comments or actions which willfully disrupt the meeting.  All remarks 
and questions shall be addressed to the Council as a whole and not to any particular member.  No individual 
Councilmember or member of the City staff shall be questioned without first obtaining permission from the 
Presiding Officer.  The City Council asks that all persons - including councilmembers, staff and the public - act and 
speak respectfully.  
 

NOTICE TO PUBLIC 
 
Staff reports or other written documentation relating to each item referred to, on the Agenda, are available for 
public inspection at the following locations: Office of the City Clerk, 650 N. La Cadena Drive, Colton, CA; City of 
Colton Public Library, 656 9th St., Colton, CA; or the City of Colton Internet Website, www.coltonca.gov.  Any person 
having questions concerning any item on the Agenda may call the City Clerk at 370-5191 to make inquiry 
concerning the nature of the item described on the Agenda. The City Clerk shall direct inquiries to the appropriate 
office. 
 
All matters listed under the Consent Calendar are considered by the City Council to be routine and will all be 
enacted by one motion. There will be no separate discussion of these items prior to the time the City Council votes 
on the motion, unless councilmembers, staff or the public request that specific items be discussed and/or removed 
for separate discussions or action. 
 
In compliance with the American with Disabilities Act, if you need special assistance to participate in a City Meeting, 
please contact the City Clerk’s Office at 909-370-5001.  Notification 48 hours prior to the meeting will enable the 
City to make reasonable arrangements to ensure accessibility to this meeting.  

 
LEGAL CHALLENGES 

 
If you challenge in court any discussion or action taken concerning an item on this Agenda, you may be limited to 
raising only those issues you or someone else raised during the meeting or in written correspondence delivered to 
the City at or prior to the City's consideration of the item at the meeting. 
 

MANUAL OF PROCEDURE 
 
The City Council adopted its Manual of Procedure pursuant to Resolution No. R-150-07; Amended by Minute Action 
on December 2, 2014 and adopted by Resolution No. R-03-15 on January 20, 2015.  Copies are available in the 
Office of the City Clerk. 

12/06/2016 City Council Agenda

http://www.coltonca.gov/


 

 

 

 

 

THIS PAGE WAS INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 



1

112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 

 

 

 

Revised Resolution with Certification of Election will 

be provided on Tuesday prior to Council Meeting. 

612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



CITY OF COLTON 
CITY COUNCIL/SUCCESSOR AGENCY TO THE REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY 

FOR THE CITY OF COLTON/COLTON UTILITY AUTHORITY/ 
COLTON PUBLIC FINANCING AUTHORITY AND  

COLTON HOUSING AUTHORITY  
CLOSED SESSION MINUTES 

November 15, 2016 

Closed Session Meeting was held on the above given date at 5:00 p.m., in the Council Chambers of City Hall, 
with Mayor DeLaRosa presiding. 

CITY COUNCIL ROLL CALL 
Councilmembers present were, Toro (appeared at 5:10 p.m.), Jorrin, Navarro, González, Bennett (absent), MPT 
Suchil (appeared at 5:10 p.m.); Mayor DeLaRosa.  

STAFF PRESENT 
City Manager Smith, Asst. City Attorney Martinez, and City Clerk Padilla. 

PUBLIC COMMENT 
None 

CLOSED SESSION  
Asst. City Attorney Martinez announced the City Council would meet in Closed Session to Discuss Item A 
through D. 

A. CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL – EXISTING LITIGATION 
Pursuant to Government Code section 54956.9(d) (1) 
Case Name: Ronald J. Collins v. City of Colton, Jack Morenberg, et al. 
Case Number:   San Bernardino County Superior Court Case No. CIVDS 1501669; 
US District Court, Central District, Case No. 5:15-CV-01771-CAS(KKx) 

B. CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL – EXISTING LITIGATION 
Pursuant to Government Code section 54956.9(d)(1) 
Case Name: Raymundo Rodriguez & Adriel Guitron v. City of Colton, et al. 
Case Number: USDC Case No. CV-00303-SGL-OP; 
US Court of Appeals, 9th Circuit, Case No. 09-55149 

C. CONFERENCE WITH LABOR NEGOTIATORS  
Pursuant to Government Code Section 54957.6 
Agency designated representatives:  Elvie Balderrama, Human Resources Director  
Employee Groups:  General Unit, Mid-Management Unit, Confidential Group, Colton Police Officers 
Association, Colton Police Management Association, Colton Police Dispatchers Association, Colton 
Fire Association; International Brotherhood of Electrical Workers (IBEW), Water and Wastewater 

D. PUBLIC EMPLOYEE PERFORMANCE EVALUATION 
Pursuant to Government Code section 54957(b) 
Title: Executive Administrator to the Mayor and City Council 

Item No. 2

712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



Mayor DeLaRosa adjourned the meeting to Closed Session at 5:02 p.m. and at 6:08 p.m., the meeting 
reconvened, with all members present except CM Bennett absent. 
 
Asst. City Attorney Martinez announced that the City Council met in Closed Session and discussed Item A 
through D; with direction given to staff and no reportable action. 
 
 

CITY COUNCIL/SUCCESSOR AGENCY TO THE REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY FOR THE CITY OF 
COLTON/COLTON UTILITY AUTHORITY/ 

COLTON PUBLIC FINANCING AUTHORITY AND 
COLTON HOUSING AUTHORITY 
REGULAR MEETING MINUTES 

 
November 15, 2016 

 
Regular Meeting held on the above-given date at 6:11 p.m. in the Council Chambers of City Hall, with Mayor 
DeLaRosa presiding. 
 
INVOCATION/FLAG SALUTE 
Pastor Tom Dicus, Colton Christian Church 
 
CITY COUNCIL ROLL CALL 
 
Council Members Present    Staff Present 
Richard A. DeLaRosa, Mayor   William R. Smith, City Manager 
David J. Toro        Marco Martínez, Asst. City Attorney 
Summer Jorrin      Carolina R. Padilla, City Clerk 
Frank J. Navarro 
Dr. Luis S. González 
Isaac T. Suchil, Mayor Pro Tem (appeared at 6:12 p.m.) 
 
Council Members Absent 
Deirdre H. Bennett (excused) 
 
CEREMONIAL MATTERS  
 

• Recognition - Employees Retiring at the end of the Year 2016 
The following retired employees were introduced by their Managers/Supervisors by Department/Division: 
 
Customer Service 
Nicole Mihld, Customer Service Manager 
Retiree: Rosemarie Gonzales, Customer Service Representative II – 28 years of service; 
 
Fire Department 
Tim McHarque, Fire Chief 
Retiree: Alan Sork, Fire Marshall – 25 years of service; 
 
Parks Division 
David Kolk, Director 
Retiree: Alonso Garcia, Production Supervisor – 35 years of service. 
 

812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



Mayor DeLaRosa, on behalf of the Council, presented a retirement Proclamation to each retiree. 
 

• Presentation – Donation of Fire Department T-Shirt Sales to Susan G. Komen Foundation for cancer 
research 

Tom DeBellis, Public Information Officer and President Professional Fire Fighters Association presented a 
check of $1,000.00 to the Susan G. Koman Foundation; accepted by Jill Eaton, Executive Director of the Inland 
Empire Division of the Susan G. Koman Foundation. 
 
 
MAYOR AND COUNCIL ITEMS 
 
POSSIBLE CONFLICT OF INTEREST DISCLOSURES FOR THE COUNCIL MEETING OF NOVEMBER 
15, 2016. 
 
GIFT DISCLOSURES 
Mayor DeLaRosa asked the members present if there were any agenda items that were a conflict of interest 
pursuant to CMC Section 2.04.030. None disclosed. 
 
AB 1234 ORAL REPORTS 
Mayor DeLaRosa asked the members present if there were any brief reports on meetings attended at the 
expense of the City. (GC Section 53232.3(d). None disclosed. 
 
CITY TREASURER’S REPORTS 
 

• Receive and File City Treasurer’s Report for August 2016. 
City Treasurer Aurelio De La Torre presented the treasurer’s report for August 2016 for Council consideration 
and with no objection report was received and filed by Councilmembers present. 
 
PUBLIC COMMENT 
The following community members addressed the Council: Patricia Moreno. 
 
Consent Calendar 
Item 10 – Award of Contract of Inland Empire Landscape 
Linda Tripp 
 
Business Item 
Item 18 – Employment Agreement for the Executive Administrator to the Mayor or Council 
Annette Lira 
 
CONSENT CALENDAR 
Mayor DeLaRosa presented the Consent Calendar Items 1 through 14. 
 
Councilmembers present selected items for discussion and clarification by staff: CM Toro/CM Navarro/MPT 
Suchil/Mayor DeLaRosa, Item 10. 
 
Motion and Second by CM Navarro/CM González to approve the Consent Calendar Items 1 through 14. 
Vote: Motion carried with CM Bennett absent. 
 
(1) Minutes – Approval of Minutes for the City Council Regular Meeting Held November 1, 2016 on File in 

the Office of the City Clerk. 
 

912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



(2) Warrants – Approval of Payable Warrants dated 10/13/2016 and totaling $36,399.42; voucher numbers 
159086 to 159228 dated 10/27/2016 and totaling $1,710,742.96; voucher numbers 159229 to 159374 
dated 11/03/2016 and totaling $2,950,299.63 and a payroll disbursement listing for the period 
10/08/2016 to 10/21/2016 and totaling $757,010.53. 
 

(3) Disposition of Surplus Item and Sale to Council Member Bennett – It is recommended that the City 
Council declare as surplus a table-top, decorative water fountain, which was a gift to the City Council 
from Colton’s Sister City in Mexico, during the active period of the Sister City Program. It is further 
recommended that this item be purchased by Council Member Bennett in the amount of $1.00. 

 
(4) Side Letter Agreement/CPOA - Authorize the City Manager to enter into a side letter agreement with the 

Colton Police Officers Association (CPOA) to amend Section 2 of the MOU regarding holiday accrual 
and use. 
 

(5) Side Letter Agreement/CPMA - Authorize the City Manager to enter into a side letter agreement with 
the Colton Police Management Association (CPMA) to amend Section 1 Vacation to include vacation 
buy back language and Section 2 of the MOU regarding holiday accrual. 
 

(6) Amendment No. 1 with Development Management Group, Inc. – Approve Amendment No. 1 with 
Development Management Group, Inc. for Economic Development Consulting Services. 

 
(7) Short Term Lease Agreement with Ed Berki – Adopt a Resolution approving a short term Lease 

agreement with Ed Berki for the property located at 1595 Valley Boulevard, Colton, RESOLUTION 
NO. R-111-16. 
 

(8) Professional Services Agreement with Criterion Automation – Approve a second amendment to the 
City’s existing Professional Services Agreement with Criterion Automation in an additional amount not 
to exceed $50,000 for an ongoing Water and Wastewater Supervisory Control and Data Acquisition 
(SCADA) System Maintenance, retrofit and upgrade services, with the total aggregate amount not to 
exceed $77,000.  

 
(9) Purchase of Two Electric Vehicles – Waive the formal bidding process and authorize the City of Colton 

to piggyback on the State of California’s bid award for the purchase of two new Nissan Leaf Electric 
Vehicles for the total amount of $48,209.18 in accordance with Colton Municipal Code 3.08.140(c). 

 
(10) Award of Contract to Inland Empire Landscape – Approve a Resolution to amend FY 2016-17 Lighting 

Maintenance Assessment Districts 1 and 2 (LLMD 1 and 2) to increase the expenditure in the amount of 
$23,652; Approve the award of maintenance services agreement for the LLMD 1 and 2 to Inland Empire 
Landscape for FY 2016-17, in the amount not-to-exceed $102,652 from December 1, 2016 to June 30, 
2017, and authorize the City Manager to execute the contract documents; Authorize the City Manager to 
exercise the renewal option to extend the agreement for FY 2017-18, with a monthly cost of $14,664.53 
($175,974.36 for the period July 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018) if the City is satisfied with the 
Contractor’s performance, RESOLUTION NO. R-112-16. 
 

(11) Laurel Grade Separation Project- Temporary Truck Route - Approve a Resolution amending the FY16-
17 Capital Improvement Program (CIP) budget increasing account #451-1103-6987-3890 in the amount 
of $26,070 to restore the traffic signal and striping that were modified to serve as a temporary truck 
route during construction of Laurel Grade Separation Project, RESOLUTION NO. R-113-16. 
 

(12) I-10 FWY/ Mt. Vernon Ave Interchange Project - Approve a Resolution to reapprove Resolution R-01-
16 that establishes an appropriation for the I-10 Freeway/ Mt. Vernon Avenue Interchange Project in the 

1012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



amount of $31,314 and amend the Capital Improvement Program (CIP) to include the Project, 
RESOLUTION NO. R-114-16. 
 

(13) Notice of Completion - Authorize the execution and recordation of Notice of Completion for the 
Sycamore Avenue Asphalt Paving Project. 
 

(14) Local Goals and Policies Concerning Districts Formed Pursuant to the Mello-Roos Community 
Facilities Act of 1982 – Approve a Resolution to adopt Local Goals and Policies concerning Districts 
formed pursuant to the Mello-Roos Community Facilities Act of 1982, RESOLUTION NO. R-115-16. 

 
BUSINESS ITEMS 
 
(15) Hub City Centre Economic Investment Inducement Program – Authorize staff to begin implementation 

of the Hub City Centre Specific Plan Economic Investment Inducement Program (“Hub Economic 
Investment Program”) subject to approval of each individual Operating Covenant Agreement. 

 
Staff Presentation 
Mark Tomich, Development Services Director, and Michael Bracken, Managing Partner & Chief Economic 
Development Management Group, Inc. presented to Council for consideration/consensus an economic 
investment inducement program; detail information provided with the assistance of a PowerPoint presentation 
“Hub City Economic Investment Program”. 
 
Council Discussion 
Discussion by Councilmembers present with clarification provided by staff: Director Tomich and Michael 
Bracken. 
 
Consensus by Councilmembers present to authorize implementation of the investment program to induce 
economic investment in the Hub City Centre Specific Plan (Individual Operating Covenant Agreements will 
come to the City Council for approval). 
 
(16) Administration of the City’s Zoning Code – Consider Introduction of an Ordinance Amending portions 

of Chapter 18.58 of the Colton Municipal Code relating to the Administration of the City’s Zoning 
Code, ORDINANCE NO. O-24-16: An Ordinance of the City Council of the City of Colton Amending 
Portions of Chapter 18.58 of Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code Relating to Administration of the 
City’s Zoning Code. 

 
Staff Presentation 
Asst. City Attorney Martinez present for consideration an overview of the agenda report; this Ordinance amends 
administrative provisions of the Zoning Code; the Council may consider this Ordinance directly like other 
ordinances; however, if the Council wishes to seek the Planning Commission’s input, it is free to refer the 
matter to the Planning Commission. 
 
Public Comment 
None 
 
Council Discussion 
Discussion by Councilmembers present with clarification provided by staff: Asst. City Attorney Martinez. 
 
Consensus by Councilmembers present to send the ordinance to the Planning Commission for their input and 
return to Council for final consideration in a timely manner. 
 

1112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



(17) Amendment to Municipal Code Relating to Executive Assistant to the Council/Office Manager and 
section 2.04.040 itself - Waive full reading and introduce by title only Ordinance No. O-25-16, an 
Ordinance of the City Council of the City of Colton amending the title of Section 2.04.040 of Chapter 
2.04 of the Colton Municipal Code relating to the Executive Assistant to the Council/Office Manager 
and Section 2.04.040 itself, ORDINANCE NO. O-25-16. 

 
Staff Presentation 
Asst. City Attorney Martinez presented this item for Council consideration and action; previously in 2014 
action was taken by Council to retitle and reallocate the position, however, the title in the Colton Municipal 
Code has not been amended to reflect this reclassification; Item 18 of the Agenda cannot go forward at this time 
until Council will waive full reading and introduce by title only Ordinance No. O-25-16; and in order to allow 
this proposed ordinance to become effective sooner, Council may consider adjourning the November 15, 2016 
Regular City Council meeting to a date and time certain five days later, at which time this proposed ordinance 
can be adopted (second reading). 
 
Motion and Second by Mayor DeLaRosa/CM Jorrin to waive full reading, read by title only, introduce 
Ordinance No. O-25-16; and adjourn meeting to Wednesday, November 23, 2016, at 5:30 p.m. to waive full 
reading and pass second reading of Ordinance No. O-25-16. 
Vote: Motion carried with CM Bennett absent. 
 
(18) Employment Agreement for the Executive Administrator to the Mayor and Council – Approve the 

employment agreement between the City of Colton and the Executive Administrator to the Mayor and 
Council. 

 
Motion and Second by CM Navarro/ CM González to continue Item 18 to Wednesday, November 23, 2016, at 
5:30 p.m. 
Vote: Motion carried with CM Bennett absent. 
 
MAYOR AND COUNCIL ORAL REPORTS AND COMMENTS 
Council Members made comments on various issues and activities throughout the community. 
 
CITY MANAGER’S REPORTS 
City Manager Smith referred Council to the conceptual design on the dais for the newest business welcome 
packet; asked for Council feedback before the packed is finalized for distribution by staff. 
 
ADJOURNMENT 
At 7:50 p.m. Mayor DeLaRosa adjourned the regular council meeting to November 23, 2016 at 5:30 p.m. 
 
 
 
 
_________________________________ 
Carolina R. Padilla 
City Clerk 

1212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



CITY OF COLTON 
CITY COUNCIL/SUCCESSOR AGENCY TO THE REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY 

 FOR THE CITY OF COLTON/COLTON UTILITY AUTHORITY/ 
COLTON PUBLIC FINANCING AUTHORITY AND  

COLTON HOUSING AUTHORITY  
ADJOURNED REGULAR MEETING 

 
November 23, 2016 

 
In accordance with notice duly and legally given, an Adjourned Regular Meeting of the City 
Council of the City of Colton was held on the above given date at 5:33 p.m., in the Council 
Chambers of City Hall, Mayor Pro Tem Suchil presiding. 
 
CITY COUNCIL ROLL CALL 
Councilmembers present were, Toro, Navarro, González, MPT Suchil, and Mayor DeLaRosa; 
with Jorrin and Bennett absent. 
 
STAFF PRESENT 
City Manager Smith, Asst. City Attorney Martinez, and City Clerk Padilla. 
 
Public Comment 
None 
 
CONSENT CALENDAR 
Mayor DeLaRosa presented the Consent Calendar Item 1. 
 
Councilmembers present selected items for discussion and clarification by staff: None 
 
(1) Second Reading of Ordinance No. O-25-16 - Waive full reading and pass second reading 

of Ordinance No. O-25-16, amending the title of Section 2.04.040 of Chapter 2.04 of the 
Colton Municipal Code relating to the Executive Assistant to the Council/Office Manager 
and Section 2.04.040 itself, ORDINANCE NO. O-25-16. 

 
Motion and Second by MPT Suchil/CM Navarro to waive full reading and pass second reading 
of Ordinance No. O-25-16. 
Vote: Motion carried with CM Jorrin and CM Bennett absent. 
 
BUSINESS ITEMS 
 
(2) Employment Agreement for the Executive Administrator to the Mayor and Council – 

Approve the employment agreement between the City of Colton and the Executive 
Administrator to the Mayor and Council. (Previous Item 18 – Council Meeting of 
November 15, 2016).  

 
Motion and Second by MPT Suchil/CM Navarro to continue Item 2 to the next Regular Council 
Meeting of December 6, 2016. 
Vote: Motion carried with CM Jorrin and CM Bennett absent. 
 

1312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 
ADJOURNMENT 
At 5:38 p.m. Mayor DeLaRosa adjourned the Adjourned Regular Council Meeting. 
 
 
 
_________________________________ 
Carolina R. Padilla 
City Clerk 
 

1412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



CITY OF COLTON 
CITY COUNCIL/SUCCESSOR AGENCY TO THE REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY 

 FOR THE CITY OF COLTON/COLTON UTILITY AUTHORITY/ 
COLTON PUBLIC FINANCING AUTHORITY AND  

COLTON HOUSING AUTHORITY  
SPECIAL MEETING MINUTES 

 
November 23, 2016 

 
A Special Meeting of the City Council of the City of Colton was held at 5:39 p.m. on the above-
given date in the Council Chambers of City Hall, located at 650 North La Cadena Drive, Colton, 
California, Mayor DeLaRosa presiding. Notice of Special Meeting was given on November 22, 
2016, in compliance with Government Code Section 54954.2. 
 
CITY COUNCIL ROLL CALL 
Councilmembers present were, Toro, Navarro, González, MPT Suchil, and Mayor DeLaRosa; 
with Jorrin and Bennett absent. 
 
STAFF PRESENT 
City Manager Smith, Asst. City Attorney Martinez, and City Clerk Padilla. 
 
BUSINESS ITEMS 
 

1. Approve and Adopt a Resolution to amend the budget for Fiscal Year 2016-17 to 
appropriate additional funds for the employment agreement for the Executive 
Administrator to the Mayor and Council, RESOLUTION NO. R-116-16. 

 
Motion and Second by CM Navarro/CM González to continue Item 1 to the next Regular 
Council Meeting of December 6, 2016. 
Vote: Motion carried with CM Jorrin and CM Bennett absent. 
 
ADJOURNMENT 
At 5:42 p.m. Mayor DeLaRosa adjourned the Special Council Meeting. 
 
 
 
_________________________________ 
Carolina R. Padilla 
City Clerk 
 

1512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 

 

 

 

 

THIS PAGE WAS INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 

1612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



3

1712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



1812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



1912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



3012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



3112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



3212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



3312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



3412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



3512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



3612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



3712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



3812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



3912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



4012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



4112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



4212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



4312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



4412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



4512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



4612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



4712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



4812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



4912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



5012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



5112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



5212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



5312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



5412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



5512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



5612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



5712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



5812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



5912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 

 

 

 

 

THIS PAGE WAS INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 

6012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



4

6112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



6212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



6312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



6412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



5

6512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



6612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



6712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



6812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



6

6912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



7012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



7112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



7212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



7

7312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



7412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



7512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



7612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



7712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



ORDINANCE NO. O-26-16 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COLTON, 

CALIFORNIA, ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2016 CALIFORNIA 

BUILDING CODE, INCORPORATING THE "INTERNATIONAL BUILDING 

CODE, VOLUMES 1 AND 2", 2015 EDITION INCLUDING APPENDICES 

THERETO; 2016 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, INCORPORATING 

THE “INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE” 2015 EDITION 

INCLUDING APPENDICES THERETO; THE 2016  CALIFORNIA 

MECHANICAL CODE, INCORPORATING THE "UNIFORM MECHANICAL 

CODE", 2015 EDITION; INCLUDING APPENDICES THERETO; THE 2016  

CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, INCORPORATING THE "UNIFORM 

PLUMBING CODE", 2015 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDICES THERETO; 

THE 2016 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, INCORPORATING THE 

"NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE", 2014 EDITION, INCLUDING 

ANNEXES THERETO; 2016 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS 

CODE INCLUDING APPENDICES THERETO; TOGETHER WITH 

CERTAIN AMENDMENTS, DELETIONS, ADDITIONS, AND EXCEPTIONS. 
 

RECITALS. 
 
WHEREAS, Government Code Section 50022.1, et seq., authorizes the adoption by reference of the 
Codes specified in the title of the Ordinance. 

 
WHEREAS, At least one copy of each of said Codes certified as full, true and correct by the City Clerk 
of the City of Colton have been filed in the Office of the City Clerk in accordance with the provisions 
of Government Code Section 50022.6. 

 
WHEREAS, a duly noticed public hearing, as required by California Government Code Section 
50022.3, has been conducted and concluded prior to the adoption of this Ordinance. 

 
WHEREAS, all legal prerequisites to the adoption of this Ordinance have occurred. 
 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, the City Council of the City of Colton ordains as follows: 
 
SECTION 1: The City Council incorporates the Recitals set forth above by this reference. 

 
SECTION 2: Chapters 15.04, 15.06, 15.07, 15.08, 15.09, 15.10, 15.11, 15.12, and 15.13 of Title 15 of 

the Colton Municipal Code, entitled Buildings and Construction, are hereby added and amended as 

provided for herein, provided that said amendments shall not apply to or excuse any violation thereof 

occurring prior to the effective date of this Ordinance and provided further that the provisions of Title 15 

as exist prior to the adoption of this Ordinance shall continue to be applicable  to construction for which 

permits have been issued prior to the effective date of this Ordinance.  Moreover, this Ordinance does not 

amend or revoke any previously established fees referenced in this Ordinance. 

 
SECTION 3:  Chapter 15.04 of Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows: 
 

 

7812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



"CHAPTER 15.04 
 

 CODES ADOPTION 
 

Section: 

 15.04.010 Codes adoption. 

 15.04.020 Violations. 

 

15.04.010  Codes adoption. 
 

The 2016 California Building Code, incorporating the "International Building Code, 

Volumes 1 and 2", 2015 Edition, including all appendices thereto; the 2016 California 

Residential Code, incorporating the “International Residential Code”, 2015 Edition, 

including all appendices thereto; the 2016 California Mechanical Code, incorporating the 

"Uniform Mechanical Code", 2015 Edition; including all appendices thereto; the 2016 

California Plumbing Code, incorporating the "Uniform Plumbing Code", 2015 Edition, 

including all appendices thereto; the 2016 California Electrical Code, incorporating the " 

National Electrical Code ", 2014 Edition; including all annexes thereto; 2016 California 

Green Building Standards Code; are hereby adopted by reference in their entirety and 

amended in Chapters 15.06, 15.07, 15.08, 15.09, 15.10, 15.11, 15.12, and 15.13 herein, 

shall comprise the Building and Construction Regulations of the City of Colton." 

 

15.04.020  Violations. 
 

A. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation to erect, construct, enlarge, 
alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert, or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain 
any building or structure in the City, or cause the same to be done, contrary to, or in 
violation of , any of the provisions of the codes. 
  
B.  Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of the provisions of the code is 
guilty of a misdemeanor.  Each and every day, or portion thereof, during which any such 
violation is committed, continued, or permitted, is a separate offense.  Any such violation 
shall be punishable by such fines and penalties as described in Chapter 8.12 of the Colton 
Municipal Code.” 
 

SECTION 4:  Chapter 15.06 of Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows: 

 
“CHAPTER 15.06 

 

7912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



                                        BUILDING CODE  

Sections: 

15.06.005  Section [A] 101.4 amended – Referenced Codes. 
15.06.010 Section [A] 105.2 amended – Work exempt from permit. 

         15.06.020 Section [A] 105.5 amended – Expiration. 
 15.06.030    Section City Ordinance section added- – Permit Issuance. 

15.06.040 Sections [A] 113.1 and [A] 113.3 amended – Board of appeals. 
15.06.050  Sections [A] 114.1 and [A] 114.2 amended – Violations. 
15.06.060 Section 903 amended – Fire protection systems. 
15.06.070 Section 903.2.1 amended - Group A. 
15.06.080 Section 903.2.1.1 amended - Group A-1. 
15.06.090 Section 903.2.1.2 amended - Group A-2. 
15.06.100 Section 903.2.1.3 amended - Group A-3. 
15.06.110 Section 903.2.1.4 amended - Group A-4. 
15.06.120 Section 903.2.2 amended - Group B. 
15.06.130 Section 903.2.3 amended - Group E. 
15.06.140 Section 903.2.4 amended - Group F-1. 
15.06.150 Section 903.2.4.1 amended - Woodworking operations. 
15.06.160 Section 903.2.4.1 added - Group F-2. 
15.06.170 Section 903.2.7 amended - Group M. 
15.06.180 Section 903.2.9 amended - Group S-1. 
15.06.180 Section 903.2.10 amended - Group S-2. 
15.06.190 Section 903.2.9.1 amended - Repair Garages. 
15.06.200 Table1505.1 amended - Minimum roof covering classification. 
15.06.210 Section 1609.3 amended – Ultimate wind speed. 
15.06.220 Appendix Chapter Adopted and Amended 
15.06.230 Section J101.1 of Appendix J amended – Scope. 
15.06.240  Section J101.1 of Appendix J amended – Special requirements for        

hazardous conditions 
15.06.250  Section J103.2 of Appendix J amended – Exemptions. 
15.06.260  Section J104 of Appendix J amended – Permit application and submittal. 
15.06.270  Section J105.1 of Appendix J amended – General. 
15.06.280 Section J109.4 of Appendix J amended – Drainage across property lines. 
15.06.290  Section J110 of Appendix J amended – Temporary erosion control during 

grading. 
15.06.300   City Ordinance section Deleted -Protection of adjacent property. 
15.06.310   City Ordinance section Deleted Dust control. 

 
15.06.005  Section [A] 101.4 of Chapter 1, Division II Amended – Referenced codes. 
 

Sections [A] 101.4.1, 101.4.2, 101.4.3 and 101.4.4 of the California Building Code are 
deleted.   

 
15.06.010 Section [A] 105.2 of Chapter 1, Division II Amended - Work exempt from permit. 
 

Section [A] 105.2 of the California Building Code is hereby amended by amending item 2, 
and adding a new item 14, to read as follows: 
 
2. Chain-link, plastic, or similar fences not over 6 feet in height or masonry, wood, 

wrought iron concrete fence not over 4 feet in height above the lowest adjacent grade 
unless supporting a surcharge or impounding class I, II or III-A liquids. 

4. Retaining walls that are not over 3 feet in height measured from the bottom of the footing 
to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class I, II, or IIIA 

8012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



liquid 
14.Flag pole not to exceed 20 feet in height above ground in a residential lot 
 

15.06.020   Section [A] 105.5 of Chapter 1, Division II amended – Expiration. 
 

Section [A] 105.5 of the California Building Code is hereby amended by adding a sentence 
at the end of the section to read as follows: 

 
Building permits issued to repair under Chapter 8.04 or 8.05 of this code shall expire in 
sixty (60) days from the date such permit is issued unless the Code Enforcement and 
Housing Appeals Board authorizes a longer period of time in which to complete the work 
in which event such permit will expire at the end of such longer period of time. 
 

15.06.030  Section [A] 105.3 of Chapter 1, Division II Added – Permit Issuance. 
 
 Section [A] 105.3 of the California Building Code is amended to add subsection to read as 

follows: 
  Building permits may be issued to either: 

a). Persons holding a valid license issued by State of California State Contractor's 
License Board, related to the specialty of the work being performed, or  

b). Persons providing bona fide proof of ownership of the Property and Buildings for 
which the Permit is being issued or their authorized Representative. 

 
 

15.06.040  Section [A] 113.1 and [A] 113.3 of Chapter 1, Division II amended – Board of appeals. 
 

Sections [A] 113.1 and [A] 113.3 of Chapter 1, Division II of the California Building Code 
are hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
[A] 113.1 General. 

 
In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determination made by the 
Building Official relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be 
and is hereby created a Board of Appeals consisting of 3 members and 2 alternates who are 
qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building construction 
and who are not employees of the jurisdiction.  The Building Official shall be an ex officio 
member of and shall act as Secretary to said Board but shall have no vote on any matter 
before the Board.  The Board shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its business, 
and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate copy 
to the Building Official. 
 
[A] 113.3 Qualifications. Deleted. 

 
15.06.050  Section [A] 114.1 and [A] 114.2 of Chapter 1, Division II amended –Violations. 
 
    Sections [A] 114.1 and [A] 114.2 of Chapter 1, Division II of the California Building Code 

are hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

[A] 114.1 Unlawful acts.  It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, 
construct, alter, extend, repair, move, remove, demolish, occupy or maintain any building, 
structure or equipment regulated by this code, or cause same to be done, in conflict with or 
in violation of any of the provisions of this code. 

 

8112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 

http://www.qcode.us/codes/sacramento/view.php?cite=chapter_8.96&confidence=8
http://www.qcode.us/codes/sacramento/view.php?cite=chapter_8.100&confidence=8


[A] 114.2 Notice of violation.  The Building Official is authorized to serve a notice of 
violation or order on the person responsible for the erection, construction, alteration, 
extension, repair, moving removal, demolition, maintaining or occupancy of a building or 
structure in violation of the provisions of this code, or in violation of a permit or certificate 
issued under the provisions of this code.  Such order shall direct the discontinuance of the 
illegal action or condition and the abatement of the violation. 

 
15.06.060  Section 903 is amended – Fire protection systems. 
 
 Section 903.2 amended.  Section 903.2 of the California Building Code is hereby amended 

to read as follows: 
 

903.2 Where required.  Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings or 
structures shall be provided in locations described in this section regardless of fire resistive 
separation walls. In all existing structures and occupancies not equipped with an automatic 
sprinkler system, the following requirements shall apply: 
 
1. For existing buildings smaller than 5,000 square feet in gross floor area, when an addition 

causes the structure to exceed 5,000 square feet and such addition is equal to or greater 

than 50% of the existing square footage, the entire structure shall be provided with an 

automatic sprinkler system. 
 

2. For existing buildings larger than 5,000 square feet in gross floor area, when an 

addition is equal to or greater than 10% of the existing square footage, the entire 

structure shall be provided with an automatic sprinkler system. 
 

3. For existing buildings larger than 5,000 square feet in gross floor area, when extensive 

renovation or remodeling is done to more than 50% of the gross floor area, and when a 

change of use that, in the opinion of the fire code official using the guidance of this Code, 

increases the likelihood of, or increases the danger to occupants in a fire incident, the 

entire area shall be provided with an automatic sprinkler system. 
 

15.06.070 Section 903.2.1 amended.  Section 903.2.1 of the California Building Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

 
903.2.1 Group A.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings 
and portions thereof used a Group an occupancies as provided in this section. 

 
15.06.080 Section 903.2.1.1 amended.  Section 903.2.1.1 of the California Building Code is hereby 

amended to read as follows 
903.2.1.1 Group A-1.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group A-1 
occupancies where one of the following conditions exists: 

1.  The fire area meets or exceeds 5,000 square feet; 
2.  The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more; 
3.  The fire area is located on a floor other than the level of exit discharge; or 
4.   The fire area contains a multi-theater complex. 
 

15.06.090 Section 903.2.1.2 amended.  Section 903.2.1.2 of the California Building Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

 
Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group 
A-2 occupancies where one of the following conditions exist: 

1. The fire area meets or exceeds 5,000 square feet; 

8212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more; or 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than the level of exit discharge. 
 
15.06.100 Section 903.2.1.3 amended.  Section 903.2.1.3 of the California Building Code is hereby 

amended to read as follows: 
 

903.2.1.3 Group A-3.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group A-3 
occupancies where one of the following conditions exist: 

1.  The fire area meets or exceeds 5,000 square feet; 
2.  The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more; or 
3.  The fire area is located on a floor other than the level of exit discharge. 

 
15.06.110 Section 903.2.1.4 amended.  Section 903.2.1.4 of the California Building Code is hereby 

amended to read as follows: 
 

903.2.1.4 Group A-4.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group A-4 
occupancies where one of the following conditions exist: 

1.  The fire area meets or exceeds 5,000 square feet; 
2.  The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more; or 
3.  The fire area is located on a floor other than the level of exit discharge. 

 
15.06.120 Section 903.2.2 amended.  Section 903.2.2 of the California Building Code is hereby 

amended by adding the following: 
 

903.2.2.1 Group B.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for all buildings 
containing a Group B occupancy with a fire area of 5,000 square feet or greater. 

 
15.06.130 Section 903.2.3 amended.  Section 903.2.3 of the California Building Code is hereby 

amended to read as follows: 
 

903.2.3 Group E.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E 
occupancies as follows: 

 
1. Throughout all Group E fire areas 5,000 square feet or greater in area. 

 
15.06.140 Section 903.2.4 amended.  Section 903.2.4 of the California Building Code is hereby 

amended to read as follows: 
 

903.2.4 Group F-1.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exist: 

1.  Where the fire area meets or exceeds 5,000 square feet; or 
2.  Where the fire area is located more than three stories above grade. 
3.  A Group F-1 occupancy used for the manufacture of upholstered furniture or 

mattresses exceeds 2,500 square feet. 
 

 

15.06.150 Section 903.2.4.1 amended.  Section 903.2.4.1 of the California Building Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

 
903.2.4.1 Woodworking operations.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided 
throughout all buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy that contains woodworking 
operations in excess of 2,500 square feet and which generate finely divided combustible 
waste or which use finely divided combustible materials. 

8312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 
15.06.160 Section 903.2.4.2 added.  Section 903.2.4.1 is hereby added to the California Building 

Code to read as follows: 
 

903.2.4.2 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group F-2 occupancy where one of the following conditions exist:  

1.  Where the fire area meets or exceeds 5,000 square feet; or  
2.  Where the fire area is located more than three stories above grade.  
3.   A Group F-2 occupancy used for metal products for either fabrication 

and/or assembly exceeds 2,500 square feet.  
 

15.06.170 Section 903.2.7 amended.  Section 903.2.7 of the California Building Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

 
903.2.7 Group M.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings 
containing Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exist: 

1.  Where the fire area meets or exceeds 5,000 square feet; or 
2.  Where the fire area is located more than 3 stories above grade. 

 
15.06.180 Section 903.2.9 amended.  Section 903.2.9 of the California Building Code is hereby 

amended to read as follows: 
 

903.2.9 Group S-1.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exist: 

1.   The fire area meets or exceeds 5,000 square feet; or 
2.   The fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 
3.  A Group S-1 occupancy used for the manufacture of upholstered furniture or 

mattresses exceeds 2,500 square feet. 
 

15.06.190 Section 903.2.9.1 amended.  Section 903.2.9.1 of the California Building Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

 
903.2.9.1 Repair garages.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in all 
buildings containing repair garages in accordance with the Building Code as follows: 

 
1. Where the fire area meets or exceeds 5,000 square feet. 

 
Section 903.2.10 amended.  Section 903.2.10 of the California Building Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 
 
 
Section 903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 

all buildings containing an enclosed parking garage in accordance with Section 406.6 of 

the California Building Code where one of the following conditions exist: 

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed garage exceeds 5,000 square feet; or 

2. Where the enclosed parking garage is located beneath other groups.  

 
15.06.200  Table 1505.1 Amended – Minimum roof covering classification 
 

Table 1505.1 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows: Table 

8412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



1505.1 Minimum Roof Covering Classification for different types of construction for new 
buildings, re-roofs or additions. 

 
IA IB IIA IIB IIIA IIIB IV VA VB 
A A A A A A B* B* B* 

    *See Section 1505.1.1 for Class A Roof Coverings in Very-High Fire Hazard Severity 
 
15.06.210   Section 1609.3 amended – Basic wind speed. 
 

Section 1609.3 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to by adding a sentence 
at the end of the section to read as follows: 

  
For the City of Colton, new structures shall be designed for a minimum wind speed as 
follows: 
Risk Category I   –           100 mph, Vult’.   -  Exposure “C” 
Risk Category II –            110 mph, Vult’.   -  Exposure “C” 
Risk Category III & IV – 115 mph, Vult’.   -  Exposure “C” 
 
 

15.06.220  Appendix Chapters Adopted. 
 

Appendices chapters C, F, G, H, I, J, K, L, in the California Building Code are hereby 
Adopted. 
 
 
 

15.06.230   Section J101-1 of Appendix J amended - Scope 
 

Section J101.1 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
J101.1 Scope.  The provisions of this chapter apply to grading, excavation and earthwork 
construction, including fills and embankments.  Where conflicts occur between the 
technical requirements of this chapter and the geotechnical report, the geotechnical report 
shall govern.  In addition, the designs of the work as described above need to meet the 
recognized and accepted civil and geotechnical engineering practices and principles. 
 
 

15.06.240  Section J101 of Appendix J amended – Special requirements for hazardous 
conditions. 

 

 Section J101, a second paragraph is added to the California Building Code 

to read as follows: 

J101 General. Whenever the Building Official determines that any existing excavation or 

embankment or fill on private property has become a hazard to life and limb, or endangers 

property, or adversely affects the safety, use or stability of a public way or drainage 

channel, the owner of the property upon which the excavation or fill is located, or other 

person or agent in control of said property, upon receipt of notice in writing from the 

Building Official, shall within the period specified therein repair or eliminate such 

excavation or embankment to eliminate the hazard and to be in conformance with the 

requirements of this code. 

8512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 

15.06.250  Section J103.2 of Appendix J - amended – Exemptions. 
 

Section J103.2 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

J103.2 Exemptions: 

 

A grading permit is not required for the following: 
 

1.  When approved by the Building Official, grading in an isolated, self-contained area 
if there is no danger to private or public property. 

 

2.  An excavation below finished grade for basements and footings of a building, 
retaining wall or other structure authorized by a valid building permit.  This shall 
not exempt any fill made with the material from such excavation or exempt any 
excavation having an unsupported height greater than 5 feet (1524mm) after the 
completion of such structure. 

 
5. Excavations for wells or tunnels or utilities. 
 
6. Mining, quarrying, excavating, processing or stockpiling of rock, sand, gravel, 

aggregate or clay where established and provided for by law, provided such 
operations do not affect the lateral support or increase the stresses in or pressure 
upon any adjacent or contiguous property. 

 
7. Exploratory excavations under the direction of soil engineers or engineering 

geologists. 

 

15.06.270  Section J105.1 of Appendix J amended – General  

 

Section J105.1 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:   

 

J105.1 General. Inspections shall be governed by Section 110, Chapter 1, Division II of 
this code and requirements established, by approved policies and procedures of the 
Engineering Division. An engineer shall provide grading inspections and certifications for 
the work. 

 

15.06.280  Section J109.4 of Appendix J amended – Drainage across property lines. 

 

Section J109.4 of the California Building Code is amended to have the following sentences 
added at the end of the section: 

 

For Single Family Lot Drainage 

 

1. Whenever possible, drainage from single family lots shall flow directly to a street  or 

an approved location 

 

2. If it should be determined necessary to allow offside drainage to flow through a single 

family lot (to preserve down lot views, esthetics, accept flow from offsite property, 

etc.), the following shall apply: 

 

a. Drainage from only one lot shall flow through only one other lot. 

8612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 

b. A drainage easement shall be provided/obtained over the lot accepting the 

drainage. 

 

c. The drainage shall be contained within either a concrete/rock lined swale or a 

reinforced concrete pipe. 

 

d. The drainage facility shall be designed with excess capacity to account for the 

probable lack of necessary maintenance.  Therefore, it shall be designed to 

convey two times the runoff from a 100 year storm with the minimum diameter 

for a pipe being 12 inches. 

 

  

SECTION 5: Chapter 15.07 is hereby added to Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code to read as 
follows: 
 

 

“CHAPTER 15.07 

 

RESIDENTIAL BUILDING CODE 

 
Sections: 

 
15.07.010    Section 1.8.8 of Chapter 1, Division I amended – Board of appeals. 

15.07.020   Section R105.2 of Chapter 1, Division II amended – Work exempt from 
permit. 

   15.07.030 Section R105.5 amended – Expiration. 
15.07.040  Section R113.1 and R113.2 of Chapter 1, Division II amended  – 

    Violations. 

15.07.050  Section R301.2.1 amended – Wind limitations. 

15.07.060  Section R401.4.1 amended – Geotechnical evaluation. 

15.07.070  Section R902.1 amended – Roofing covering materials.  

15.07.080  Section Appendix Chapter Adopted. 

 

15.07.010   Section 1.8.8 of Chapter 1, Division I amended – Board of appeals. 

 

Section 1.8.8 of Chapter 1, Division I of the California Residential Code is hereby amended 
to read as follows: 

 

    1.8.8.1 General.  

 

In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determination made by the 
Building Official relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be 
and is hereby created a Board of Appeals consisting of 3 members and 2 alternates who are 
qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building construction 
and who are not employees of the jurisdiction.  The Building Official shall be an ex officio 
member of and shall act as Secretary to said Board but shall have no vote on any matter 
before the Board.  The Board shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its business, 
and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate copy 
to the Building Official. 

 
15.07.020      Section R105.2 of Chapter I, Division II amended – Work exempt from permit. 

8712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 
    Section 105.2 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended by amending item 2 

and 3 and adding a new item 11 to read as follows: 
 

2 Chain-link, plastic, or similar fences not over 6 feet in height or masonry, Wood, 
wrought iron and concrete fences not over 4 feet in height above the lowest 
adjacent grade unless supporting a surcharge or impounding class I, II or III-A 
liquids  

3 Retaining walls that are not over 3 feet in height measured from the bottom of the 
footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class 
I, II, or IIIA liquids 

11. Flag pole not to exceed 20 feet in height above ground in a residential lot. 
 

15.06.030   Section R105.5 of Chapter 1, Division II amended – Expiration. 
 

Section R105.5 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended by adding a sentence 
at the end of the section to read as follows: 

 
Building permits issued to repair under Chapter 8.04 or 8.05 of this code shall expire in 
sixty (60) days from the date such permit is issued unless the Code Enforcement and 
Housing Appeals Board authorizes a longer period of time in which to complete the work 
in which event such permit will expire at the end of such longer period of time. 

 

15.07.040  Section R113.1 and R113.2 of Chapter I, Division II – amended – Violations. 

 

    Section of R113.1 and R113.2 of Chapter 1, Division II of the California Residential Code 
is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

    R113.1 Unlawful acts.  It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, 
construct, alter, extend, repair, move, remove, demolish, occupy or maintain any building, 
structure or equipment regulated by this code, or cause same to be done, in conflict with or 
in violation of any of the provisions of this code. 

 

    R113.2 Notice of violation.  The Building Official is authorized to serve a notice of 
violation or order on the person responsible for the erection, construction, alteration, 
extension, repair, moving, removal, demolition, maintaining or occupancy of a building or 
structure in violation of the provisions of this code, or in violation of a permit or certificate 
issued under the provisions of this code.  Such order shall direct the discontinuance of the 
illegal action or condition and the abatement of the violation. 

 

15.07.050   Section R301.2.1 Amended – Wind design criteria. 

 

Section R301.2.1 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended by adding a 
sentence at the end of the section to read as follows: 

 

For the City of Colton, new structures shall be designed for a minimum wind speed Vult’ 
of 110 miles per hour 

 

15.07.070  Section R902.1 Amended - Roofing covering materials. 

 

Section R902.1 of the California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

Roofs shall be covered with materials as set forth in Sections R904 and R905.  A minimum 
Class A or B roofing shall be installed in areas designated by this section.  Classes A or B 

8812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 

http://www.qcode.us/codes/sacramento/view.php?cite=chapter_8.96&confidence=8
http://www.qcode.us/codes/sacramento/view.php?cite=chapter_8.100&confidence=8


roofing required by this section to be listed shall be tested in accordance with UL 790 or 
ASTM E 108. 

Minimum Roof Covering Classification for different types of construction for new 
buildings, re roofs or additions except for the construction of roofs in very High Fire Hazard 
Zones. 

 

IA IB IIA IIB IIIA IIIB IV VA VB 
A A A A A A B* B* B* 

     *See Section 902.1.1 for Class A Roof Coverings in Very-High Fire Hazard Severity 

 

The remaining section of the code remains the same. 

 

 

 

 

15.07.080  Appendices Adopted. 

 

    Appendices A, B, C, D, E, F, I, K, L, M, N, O, P, Q, R, & U of the California 
Residential Code are hereby adopted. 

 
 

SECTION 6: Chapter 15.08 is hereby added to Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code to read as 
follows: 

 
"CHAPTER 15.08 

 

MECHANICAL CODE 

 

Sections: 

15.08.010 Section 108.1 of Chapter 1, Division II amended – General. 

15.08.020 Section 114.2 of Chapter 1, Division II amended - Permit fees. 

15.08.030 Section 114.3 of Chapter 1, Division II amended - Plan review fees. 

15.08.040 Table 114.1 of Chapter 1, Division II deleted – Mechanical permit fees. 

15.09.050 Appendix Chapters Adopted. 

 

 

15.08.010  Section 108.1 of Chapter 1, Division II amended - General. 
 

Section 108.1 of the California Mechanical Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

108.1 General. 
 
In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determination made by the 
Building Official relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be 
and is hereby created a Board of Appeals consisting of 3 members and 2 alternates who are 
qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building construction 
and who are not employees of the jurisdiction.  The Building Official shall be an ex officio 
member of and shall act as Secretary to said Board but shall have no vote on any matter 
before the Board.  The Board shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its business, 
and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate copy 
to the Building and Safety Services Director.  

8912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 

15.08.020   Section 114.2 of Chapter 1, Division II amended - Permit fees. 

 

Section 114.2 of the California Mechanical Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

 114.2 Permit Fees. 
 

 The fee for each permit shall be as established by Resolution of the City Council. 

 

15.08.030       Section 114.3 of Chapter 1, Division II amended - Plan review fees. 

 

Section 114.3 of the California Mechanical Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

  114.3 Plan Review Fees. 
 
When Section 114.2 requires submittal documents, a plan review fee shall be paid at the 
time of submitting plans and specifications for review.  Said plan review fee shall be as set 
forth by Resolution of the City Council. 
 
Where plans are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review, an 
additional plan review fee shall be charged. 

 

15.08.040  Table 114.1 Deleted - Mechanical permit fees. 

 

    Table 114.1 Mechanical Permit Fees of the California Mechanical Code is hereby deleted.” 

 

15.09.050  Appendix Chapters Adopted. 

 

 Appendices B, C, D, E, F, and G, of the California Mechanical Code are hereby adopted. 

 

 

 

SECTION 7: Chapter 15.09 is hereby added to Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code to read as 
follows: 

 

"CHAPTER 15.09 

 

PLUMBING CODE 

  

Sections: 
 
15.09.010  Section 102.3 of Chapter 1, Division II amended – Board of appeals. 

15.09.020  Section 103.4 amended - Permit fees. 

 

15.09.030  Section 103.4.1 amended - Plan review fees. 

15.09.040  Table 103.4 deleted - Plumbing permit fees. 

15.09.050  Appendix Chapters Adopted. 

15.09.060  Section 609.3.1 added – Copper tubing. 

15.09.070  Section 701.1 amended – ABS and PVC materials. 

15.09.080  Section 701.1 amended – ABS and PVC materials for residential 
construction. 

9012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 

15.09.010  Section 102.3 of Chapter 1, Division II amended – Board of appeals. 

 

   Section 102.3 is hereby added to the California Plumbing Code read as follows: 

 

102.3. Board of appeals 

In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determination made by the 
Building Official relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be 
and is hereby created a Board of Appeals consisting of 3 members and 2 alternates who are 
qualified by experience and training to pass upon matters pertaining to building 
construction and who are not employees of the jurisdiction.  The Building Official shall be 
an ex officio member of and shall act as Secretary to said Board but shall have no vote on 
any matter before the Board.  The Board shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its 
business, and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant with a 
duplicate copy to the Building Official. 

 

15.09.020  Section 103.4 amended - Permit fees. 

 

Section 103.4 of the California Plumbing Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

103.4 Permit Fees. 
 

The fee for each permit shall be as established by Resolution of the City Council. 

 

15.09.030  Section 103.4.1 amended - Plan review fees. 

 

Section 103.4.1 of the California Plumbing Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

103.4.1 Plan Review Fees. 
 

When a plan or other data is required to be submitted by 103.2.2, a plan review fee shall 
be paid at the time of submitting plans and specifications for review.  Said plan review fee 
shall be as set forth by Resolution of the City Council.  

 

Where plans are incomplete or changed so as to require additional review, an additional 
review fee shall be charged. 

 

15.09.040      Table 103.4 deleted - Plumbing permit fees. 

 

        Table 103.4 of the California Plumbing Code is hereby deleted. 

 

15.09.050  Appendix Chapters Adopted. 
 

Appendices chapters A, B, C, D, G, H, I, J, and K. In the California plumbing Code are 
hereby adopted. 
 

 

15.09.060        Section 609.3.1 of Chapter 6 added – Copper tubing. 

 

Section 609.3.1 is hereby added to Section 609.3.1 of the California Plumbing Code to read 
as follows: 

9112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



609.3.1 Copper tubing serving plumbing fixtures within dwelling unit shall be installed 
without joints and the installation shall satisfy the following requirements. 

(1) The copper tubing shall be installed within a watertight continuous sleeve that 

prevents direct contact between the copper tubing and under-slab soils. 

 

(2) During construction the protective sleeve shall be capped at both ends until the 

copper tubing is installed and released for service. 

 

 

SECTION 8: Chapter 15.10 is hereby added to Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code to read as 
follows: 

 

"CHAPTER 15.10 

 

ELECTRICAL CODE 

 

Sections: 

15.10.010  Section 80.15 of Annex H Adopted and amended – Board of appeals. 

 

15.10.010        Section 80.15 of Annex H amended and approved– Board of appeals. 

 
Section 80.15 Annex H of the California Electrical Code is hereby amended to read as 
follows: 

 

80.15. Board of appeals. 
 

In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determination made by the 
Building Official relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be 
and is hereby created a Board of Appeals consisting of 3 members and 2 alternates who are 
qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building construction 
and who are not employees of the jurisdiction.  

 

 

SECTION 9: Chapter 15.11 is hereby added to Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code to read as 
follows: 

  

“CHAPTER 15.11 

 

GREEN BUILDING CODE 

 

Sections: 

15.11.010 [Reserved for future amendments.] 

  

15.11.010        Section [Reserved for future amendments.]” 

 

 

 

SECTION 10:    Chapter 15.12 is hereby added to Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code to read as 
follows: 

 

 

9212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



“CHAPTER 15.12 

HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE 

Sections: 

15.12.010 [Reserved for future amendments.] 

  

15.12.010        Section [Reserved for future amendments.]” 

 

 

SECTION 11: Chapter 15.13 is hereby added to Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code to read as follows: 

 

“CHAPTER 15.13 

EXISTING BUILDING CODE 

 

Sections: 

15.13.010 [Reserved for future amendments.] 

  

15.13.010        Section [Reserved for future amendments.]” 

 

 

SECTION 12: Chapter 15.16 of Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code is hereby amended to to read as 
follows: 

“Chapter 15.16  

CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

Sections: 

                                                                            15.16.020. - Establishment of limits required by the California Fire Code. 

15.16.275 Section 903.2.4.2 added - Group F-2. 

 

15.16.020. - Establishment of limits required by the California Fire Code. 

C. Bulk Storage of Liquefied Petroleum Gases. Pursuant to Section 6104.2 of 
the California Fire Code, the aggregate capacity of any one installation for the bulk 
storage of liquefied petroleum gases shall not exceed two thousand water gallons 
in residential areas. In non-residential areas, when, in the opinion of the fire code 
official  having jurisdiction, the location of bulk storage of liquefied petroleum 
gases would create a threat to the occupants and property owners, the aggregate 
storage capacity of liquefied petroleum gas Shall also be limited to two thousand 
water gallons. The fire code official shall be guided by the appropriate City or 
County Development Code when permitting the storage of liquefied petroleum 
gas in excess of two thousand water gallons at any one installation 

15.16.275 Section 903.10 added - Group F-2. 

Section 903.2.10 added to the California Fire Code to read as follows. 

903.2.10 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group F-2 occupancy where one of the following conditions exist:  

1. Where the fire area meets or exceeds 5,000 square feet; or  

9312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



2. Where the fire area is located more than three stories above grade.  

3. A Group F-2 occupancy used for metal products for either fabrication and/or assembly 
exceeds 2,500 square feet.” 

 

15.16.310.      Chapter 28 amended. 

 

Chapter 28 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended by adding the following: 

2810 Pallet Storage Yards 

2810.2 Storage location. Pallets shall be stored outside or in a separate building 

designed for pallet storage unless stored indoors in accordance with Section 

2810.3.  

 

2810.4 Outdoor storage. Pallets stored outside shall be stored in accordance with 

the    following: 

1. Stored in an orderly manner not to exceed 16 feet in height, 20 feet in 

width and 25 feet in length; 

2. Pile separation shall be a minimum of 20 feet and no closer than 26 

feet to property lines or exposures .  

 

 
SECTION 13: Chapter 15.49.140 is hereby amended in Title 15 of the Colton Municipal Code to read as 

follows: 

“15.49.140 Violations; penalty. 

Any violations of this chapter shall be deemed a misdemeanor and shall be punished as 
provided in Section 15.04.010 of this code.” 

 

SECTION 14: Severability.  The City Council hereby declares that should any provision, section, 
paragraph, sentence or word of this Ordinance or the Code hereby adopted be 
rendered or declared invalid by any final court action in a court of competent 
jurisdiction, or by reason of any preemptive legislation, the remaining provisions, 
sections, paragraphs, sentences and words of this Ordinance and the Codes hereby 
adopted shall remain in full force and effect. 
 
 

SECTION 15: The Mayor shall sign this Ordinance and the City Clerk shall cause the same to be 
published within fifteen (15) days after its passage at least once in The San 
Bernardino County Sun, a newspaper of general circulation published in the City 
of San Bernardino. 

 
 
 
 

9412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED on this 6TH day of December, 2016. 
 
 
 
        

 

___________________________________ 

       RICHARD A. DELAROSA 

       Mayor 

 

ATTEST:  

 

 

__________________________________ 

CAROLINA R. PADILLA 

City Clerk 
  
 
 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

 

 

__________________________________ 

Best Best & Krieger LLP 
City Attorney 
 

9512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 

 

 

 

 

THIS PAGE WAS INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 

9612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



8

9712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



9812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



9912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



10012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



10112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



10212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



10312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



10412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



10512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



10612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



10712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



10812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



10912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



11012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



11112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



11212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



11312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



11412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



11512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



11612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



11712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



11812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



11912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



12012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



12112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



12212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



12312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



12412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



12512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



12612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



12712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



12812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



12912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



13012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



13112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



13212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



13312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



13412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



13512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



13612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



13712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



13812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



13912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



14012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



14112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



14212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



14312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



14412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



14512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



14612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



14712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



14812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



14912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



15012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



15112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



15212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



15312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



15412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



15512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



15612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



15712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



15812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



15912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



16012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



16112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



16212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



16312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



16412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



16512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



16612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



16712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



16812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



16912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



17012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



17112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



17212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



17312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



17412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



17512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



17612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



17712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



17812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



17912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



18012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



18112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



18212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



18312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



18412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



18512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



18612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



18712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



18812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



18912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



19012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



19112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



19212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



19312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



19412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



19512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



19612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



19712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



19812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



19912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



20012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



20112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



20212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



20312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



20412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



20512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



20612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



20712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



20812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



20912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



21012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



21112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



21212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



21312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



21412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



21512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



21612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



21712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



21812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



21912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



22012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



22112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



22212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



22312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



22412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



22512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



22612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



22712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



22812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



22912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



23012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



23112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



23212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



23312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



23412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



23512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



23612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



23712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



23812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



23912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



24012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



24112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



24212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



24312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



24412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



24512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



24612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



24712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



24812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



24912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



25012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



25112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



25212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



25312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



25412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



25512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



25612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



25712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



25812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



25912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



26012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



26112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



26212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



26312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



26412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



9

26512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



 

 

 

 

 

THIS PAGE WAS INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 

26612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



10

26712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



26812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



26912/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



27012/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



27112/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



27212/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



27312/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



27412/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



27512/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



27612/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



27712/06/2016 City Council Agenda 



27812/06/2016 City Council Agenda 


	12/06/16 Agenda
	Item No. 1 - Canvass of Election
	Item No. 2 - Minutes
	Item No. 3 - Warrants
	Item No. 4 - Adopt Fine Increases
	Item No. 5 - Contract Amendment Department of Education Pre School
	Item No. 6 - Contract Amendment Department of Education School Age
	Item No. 7 - 2016 Building Code Adoption (by Reference)
	Item No. 8 - Appeal File Index No. DAP-001-371
	Item No. 9 - A Specific Plan Amendment for amendments to the Colton’s Hub City Centre Specific Plan
	Item No. 10 - Employment Agreement and Budget Resolution for the Executive Administrator to the Mayor and Council



